JENNIFER BERTINO-TARRANT
WILL COUNTY EXECUTIVE

WILL COUNTY, ILLINOIS

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

KEVIN LYNN
DIRECTOR

P. 815-740-4712 County Office Building

F. 815-740-4604 302 N. Chicago Street

E. klynn@willcountyillinois.com Joliet, IL 60432
BID # 2022-28

SHNH HOUSEKEEPING SUPPLIES BID

ADDENDUM #1
February 7, 2022

We received the following questions regarding this bid:
Question # 1: May | have the previous bid tabulations & award information?

Answer # 1. Please see attached bid tabulation and award documents

Question # 2: Looking back at the addendums from the 2019 Bid, we see there are some corrections on the
specs for the Trash Liners, we notice the current bid has some of the same specs as the ones that were
corrected. We want to make sure the descriptions now are correct?

Answer # 2: Please replace the specifications for items #6-#9 - Can Liners with the following information,
change the quantities on the bid form to those listed below and include samples per these specifications

6. CAN LINERS:
30" X 47" — 1-6mil. (20 gal)  [d6Mic
Color: Clear
How many in case: 100 250 case
Present Usage of current product yearly: 380-cases (480)
Price per case
Extended cost of 380 cases (480)
7. CAN LINERS:

30" X 37": 43 MIC density 16mic
Color: Clear
How many in case: 1000 500

Present Usage of current product yearly: 180 cases (480)
Price per case
Extended cost of 288 cases (480)

8. CAN LINERS:
24"x33", High density 6 mil. .75mil
Color: Red
# per case: 250
Present usage of current product yearly: 50 cases (30)
Price per case
Extended cost of 50 cases (30)



JENNIFER BERTINO-TARRANT
WILL COUNTY EXECUTIVE

WILL COUNTY, ILLINOIS

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

KEVIN LYNN
DIRECTOR

P. 815-740-4712 County Office Building
F. 815-740-4604 302 N. Chicago Street
E. klynn@willcountyillinois.com Joliet, IL 60432

9. CAN LINERS:
40” X 46” Low Density .76 MIL  T22'mil
Color: YELLOW

# per case: 125 100 case

Present usage of current product yearly: 450 cases (75)
Price per case
Extended cost of 450 cases (75)

Question # 3: Can you provide the Current price for the Liners?

Answer # 3: Please see attached bid tabulation and award documents for pricing information

Question # 4: Is the delivery breakdown still as listed below? If not, how has it changed?
Iltem 5 40x46 Monthly 50

Iltem 6 30x47 Bi-Monthly 15-20 Each time
Iltem 7 30x37 Monthly 45
Item 8 24x33 3 to 6 Months 15

Item 9 40x46 3 to 6 months 20?

Answer # 4: That delivery breakdown is currently correct, however is subject to change.

Question # 5: Can we call FedEx at our expense and pick up a sample of each liner? If yes, can you give us
the address where FedEx should go, a contact name, phone number & email address, and times that FedEx
can come?

Answer # 5: Will County will not provide samples of our current liners.



FROM THE DESK OF

RITA WEISS
PURCHASING DIRECTOR

BID HISTORY

ITEM: 2019-28 Housekeeping Supplies Bid

DEPARTMENT: Sunny Hill Nursing Home of Will County

BID LETTING: March 11, 2019
PUBLISHED NOTICE: Herald News & Demand Star Internet
FUNDING SOURCE: Sunny Hill Nursing Home of Will County Budget
BID OPENING: March 26, 2019, 9:10 A M.
LOCATION: Will County Office Building

302 N. Chicago Street

Joliet, lll. 60432

BIDDING RESULTS:

NUMBER RELEASED: 22 + INTERNET NUMBER RETURNED: 10

BIDDER: TOTAL PRICE

See attached spreadsheets for comparison pricing and product selections.

Recommendation from Becky Haldorson, SHNH Administrator, in conjunction with Ray Vicha,
SHNH Environmental Services Director, is to split the award of this bid to three (3) bidders, for
an approximate $41,583.80 annual cost, as stipulated in the bid document; Central Poly,
Linden, NJ, for an approximate cost of $7,824.00, Tri-K Supplies, Channahon, IL, for an
approximate cost of $17,170.80 and Professional Medical, New Lenox, IL, for an
approximate cost of $16,589.00. By splitting the bid award, we will be saving approximately
$20,000.00 - $40,000.00 annually over award to one vendor.

The contract begins May 1, 2019 through April 30, 2020, with two (2) additional one (1) year
renewal options, at the discretion of Will County. These costs are approximate, based on
resident population and needs and includes consideration of 2™ and 3™ year increase in pricing,
as allowed in the bid document.
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BID TABULATION SHEET &9 Qﬂﬁém
taeVAL

DEPARTMENT:  2018-28 SHNH, Housekeeping Supplies

DUE: 3-26-19, 9:00 A.M. OPENED: 3-26-19, 9:10 A.M.
BIDDER REQUIREMENTS TOTAL COST- 1 YEAR
o BID BOND: $2849.00 Check | g 27 085 50
P PRIME CERT: Y 2o 3
Brooklyn, NY ADDENDA -3: Y e Sh
SAMPLES: Y Yr3% 3%
FORM SIGNED: Y % of disc 0%

COMPLETE BID: Partial Bid | LEAD 1-10 days

BID BOND: $
Heritage Bag Company PRIMECERT:. Y N
' Yr2%
West Chester, OH ADDENDA-3: Y
Yr3%

SAMPLES:

T
4
I
»
8
=
o
=]
(/2]
o)
=}
e
FORM S| N % of di 2
[}
co Y N g
O
I
Central Poly PRIME CERT: Y m
. Yr2% 8% £
Linden, NJ ADDENDA -3: Y S
@©
SAMPLES: Y WFR% B 3
FORM SIGNED: Y % of disc 0% &
COMPLETE BID:  Partial Bid | _EAD Within 30 days &
BID BOND: $6,000.00 $ 41.932.10 §
All American Poly PRIME CERT: Y _-g
_ Yr2% 5% =
Piscataway, NJ ADDENDA -3: Y g
SAMPLES: Y Yr3% 5% £
FORM SIGNED: Y % of disc 0% E
Q
COMPLETE BID:; Partial Bid LEAD 10-15 Days g
BID BOND: 10% $ 8705733
Mckesson Medical — Surgical PRIME CERT: Y
Yr2 % 3%
Richmond, VA ADDENDA -3: Y
SAMPLES: Y Yr3% 3%
FORM SIGNED: Y % of disc N/A
/‘) COMPLETE BID: Y LEAD 1-3 days

ALSO PRESENT: %5, KEWN, EDDIE BRADLEY
WW «. B,



BID TABULATION SHEET

DEPARTMENT:  2019-28 SHNH, Housekeeping Supplies
DUE: 3-26-19, 9:00 A.M. OPENED: 3-26-19, 9:10 A.M.
BIDDER REQUIREMENTS TOTAL COST-1 YEAR
PRIME CERT: Y .
Channahon, IL ADDENDA -3: Y Yr2% 3
SAMPLES: Y Yr3% 3
FORM SIGNED: Y % of disc 0

COMPLETE BID: Partial Bid

LEAD 1-2 Days

BID BOND: 10% Bond

Chicago, IL

IMLEs P
Heeitnot fo L.

PRIME CERT: Y
ADDENDA -3: Y

FORM SIGNED: Y
COMPLETE BID: Partial Bid

Medii $ 47,337.45
ediine 77 PRIME CERT: Y
Yr2%0
Northfield, IL ADDENDA -3: Y (2)
. Yr3% 0
Mike Calandro SAMPLES: Y
FORM SIGNED: Y % of disc 0
COMPLETE BID; Partial Bid LEAD 2 days
The Boelter Companies BID BOND: 10% Bond $ 56.272.60

Yr 2 % 0-9%
Yr3% 0-9%

% of disc 0
LEAD 5-7 Days

Professional Medical

New Lenox, IL

BID BOND: $3,740.00 Check
PRIME CERT: Y
ADDENDA -3: Y
SAMPLES: Y

FORM SIGNED: Y
COMPLETE BID: Partial

$ 37,400.60
Yr2% 4
Yr3% 0

% of disc 0
LEAD 1-2 Days

Dispose N Save

Monroe, NY

Bid Rejected, not received by 9:00 AM

BID BOND:

PRIMECERT: Y N
ADDENDA-3: Y N
SAMPLES: Y N
FORMSIGNED: Y N
COMPLETEBID: Y N

$

Yr2%
Yr3 %
% of disc

LEAD

ALSO PRESENT: RITA WEISS, KEVIN LYNN, EDDIE BRADLEY

Attachment: award docs (19-102 : Awarding Bid - Housekeeping Supplies - SHNH)




BID TABULATION SHEET

DEPARTMENT:  2019-28 SHNH, Housekeeping Supplies

DUE: 3-26-19, 9:00 A.M. OPENED: 3-26-19, 9:10 A.M.
BID BOND: 10% $ 65 55020
Gordon Food Service PRIME CERT: Y
Yr2% 5
Grand Rapids, MI ADDENDA -3: Y
. Yr3% 5
*Request 500$ min order* SAMPLESE ¥
FORM SIGNED: Y % of disc n/a
COMPLETEBID: Y LEAD 2-5 Days

Attachment: award docs (19-102 : Awarding Bid - Housekeeping Supplies - SHNH)



SUNNY—HILL

Nursing Home of Will County

ATTN: County Executive Larry Walsh

County Board Speaker Denise Winfrey
FROM: Becky Haldorson, Administrator
DATE: March 28, 2019

After carefully reviewing the bids that were received for the Housekeeping Supplies bid for Sunny Hill Nursing Home of
Will County, it is my recommendation that the County of Will award the contract totaling approximately $41,583.80
to the following three bidders, for the first year:

Tri-K Supplies $17,170.80
Channahon, IL

Professional Medical $16,589.00
New Lenox, IL

Central Poly $ 7,824.00
Northfield, IL

As demonstrated by the attached bid history and tabulation, out of the ten (10) responses, (one was disqualified
because it arrived late) the three (3) responsible bidders are being awarded the items for which they provided the
lowest cost, based on product quality, pack size and delivery.

Please contact me if you have any further questions or concerns.

Thank you.

“THE LEADER IN RESIDENT CENTERED CARE AND ACTIVE LIVING"
421 DORIS AVENUE * JOLIET, ILLINOIS * 60433
TELEPHONE (815) 727-8710* FAX(815) 727-8637
WWW.WILLCOUNTYILLINOIS.COM/SUNNYHILL

Attachment: award docs (19-102 : Awarding Bid - Housekeeping Supplies - SHNH)




Pack All American Professional Dispose N
Yr Qty |lUOM |Size Unipak Central Poly Poly Mckesson | Tri-K Supplies Medline Medical Gordon Food Boelter Co Save*
Price/ ?? Price/ ?? Price/ ?? Price/ ?? Price/ ?7? Price/ ?? Price/ ?7? Price/ ?7? Price/ ?7? Price/ ?7?
#1[TOILET PAPER 17280 RL|500/96 No Bid] $ 0.42 No Bid] $ 041} $ 0.31] $ 0.31 No Bid] $ 0.35] $ 0.32
No Bid] $ 7,205.76 No Bid] $ 7,084.80] $ 5,356.80] $ 5,427.00 No Bid] $ 5,999.59] $ 5,529.60
#2|MULTIFOLD HAND TOWELS 9600| PK|250/16 No Bid] $ 1.06 No Bid] $ 1.320 $ 0.95] $ 0.95] $ 0.87] $ 1.11] $ 1.01
No Bid] $ 10,176.00 No Bid] $12,672.00 $ 9,132.00] $ 9,072.000 $ 8,352.000 $ 10,608.00] $ 9,696.00
#3|FACIAL TISSUES 6000| BX|100/30 No Bid] $ 0.50 No Bid] $ 0.63} $ 0.52] $ 0.49] $ 0.56] $ 0.95] $ 0.57
No Bid] $ 3,000.00 No Bid] $ 3,780.00Q $ 3,120.00]1 $ 2,950.001 $ 3,348.00 $ 3,420.00
$ 5,701.94
#4|PAPER CUPS 5 OZ 24] CS|3000 No Bid No Bid No Bid] $ 96.72 No Bid] $ 70.40]1 $ 54.00] $ 80.05 No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid] $ 2,321.28 No Bid] $ 1,689.60 No Bid
$ 1,296.00] $ 1,921.20
#5[CAN LINERS 40" X 46" CLEAR 600| CS|[100 $ 14.93] $ 18.90] $ 16.22] $ 41.09) $ 14.49] $ 20.78] $ 15.33] $ 23.95| $ 18.55
$ 14,370.00
$ 8,958.000 $ 11,340.001 $ 9,730.00] $24,654.00] $ 8,694.000 $ 12,467.00] $ 9,198.00 $ 11,130.00
#6|CAN LINERS 30" X 47" CLEAR 380 CSJ|100 $ 14.25) $ 21.35] $ 26.63] $ 41.891 $ 23.58 No Bid] $ 14.50] $ 472 $ 32.30
No Bid $ 1,792.08
$ 541500 $ 8,112.000 $ 10,119.40] $15,918.20f $ 8,960.40 $ 5,510.00 $ 12,274.00
#7[CAN LINERS 30" X 37" CLEAR 480/ (CS|1000 $ 21.75) $ 16.30] $ 41.92] $ 35.381 $ 31.94] $ 22.94] $ 17.22] $ 45.74] $ 22.70
$ 21,955.20
$ 10,440.00f $ 7,824.000 $ 20,121.60] $16,982.40f $ 15,331.20f $ 11,011.20] $ 8,265.60 $ 10,896.00
#8|CAN LINERS 24" X 33" RED 30 CSJ|250 $ 27.00] $ 36.10] $ 30.62] $ 2543 $ 27.24] $ 4473 $ 15.00 No Bid| $ 32.40
$ 762.90 No Bid
$ 810.00] $ 1,083.00] $ 918.60 $ 817.20] $ 1,341.90] $ 450.00 $ 972.00
#9[CAN LINERS 40" X 46" RED 75| CS|125 $ 19.50] $ 23.00] $ 13.90] $ 41.090 $ 20.21] $ 45.05) $ 13.08] $ 29.36] $ 31.40
$ 1462500 $ 1,725.001 $ 1,04250] $ 3,081L.75] $ 1,515.75] $ 3,378.75] $ 981.00] $ 2,202.19| $ 2,355.00
1st Year Award Total (approximate spend) $ 7,824.00 $ 17,170.80 $ 16,589.00
2nd Year Award Total (approximate spend) $ 8,449.92 $ 17,685.92 $ 17,252.56
3rd Year Award Total (appro‘ximate Tpend) $ 9,125.91 $ 18,216.50 $ 17,252.56
Optional Year two (2) Percentage Increase 3%] $ 0.08 5%] $ 0.031% 0.03]% - $ 0.04]1% 0.05 | 0-9%
Optional Year three (3) Percentage Increase 3%] $ 0.08 5%] $ 0.031% 0.03]% - $ - $ 0.05 | 0-9%
Additional Percentage Discount if awarded in its 0%]| $ - 0%|$ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
Lead Time ARO 1-10 Days Within 30 10-15 Days 1-3 Days 1-2 days 2 Days 1-2 days 2-5 Days 5-7 Days

*Dispose N Save disqualified

due to late bid arrival - due at 9:00 am, received at 9:30 am

No required sample sent - disqualified item
Lowest price for item

SHNH selected items




Vendors Clear Clear Ciear Red Red Hand Toliet  Facial Paper
Products 40x46  30x47 30x37 24x33 40x46 Towels Paper Tissues Cups
Not Clear = n/c
Tri-K Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Y Y 1 0
Pro Med Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes ok 0 no/soft ok
Central Poly Yes | TooBig| Yes Yes Yes OK OK OK 0
Warehouse Direct Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes OK OK not/soft 0
MedlLine OK 0 OK 0 0K OK OK 3 OK
Mckesson 0 0 OK OK 0 OK OK 2 OK
Medical 30X36
Dispose 1 ?5 0K 6 ?7 No8 No9 0 0 0 0
Dispose 2 ?5 ok 6 ?7 thin8 | same9 0 0 0 0
#|Unipak n/é n/c n/c 0K OK 0 0 0 0
Essity Fulfillment cen 0 0 0 0 0 ok ok not/soft 0
All American Pely no5 ok 6 ok7 | same8 | same9 0 0 0 0
North American ? 0 Y391114 0 0 ok ok ok 0
Gordon Food OK 0 OK 0 (0]1¢ OK 1 not/soft ok
510912

Attachment: award docs (19-102 : Awarding Bid - Housekeeping Supplies - SHNH)
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